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 "Science without religion is lame, religion without science is blind," said Albert 
Einstein. In his latest article, hereafter “THE OTHER WORLD OR DIVINE 
CREATION OF THE UNIVERSE" I made an attempt to unite religion with 
science. Religion without proofs and science without hope standing against each 
other for 250 years of uncertainly like enemies, having no power to overcome one 
another, and finally, in the near future, the science becoming religious and religion 
scientific, becoming combined, will open the door to the invisible world of God. 
 

 Chapter 22. HOLY TRINITY. And he showed me a pure river of water of life, 
clear as crystal, proceeding out of the throne of God and of the Lamb. 
(Revelation.22-1). I read this first sentence and I had a question, what is the water 
of life that is hidden under the symbol of water. In (1In5.8) I found that this word 
means the human mind. So people, as well as the inhabitants of the Divine 
Universe – the angels derive their knowledge from the river of water of life that 
proceeds from the throne of God and the Holy Lamb.  

Where God and the Holy Lamb are, there surely must be the Holy Spirit to 
complete the Trinity. It's not difficult to guess that the river of Water of Life 
originating from the throne is the very symbol of the Holy Spirit. Here the water of 
life is the base of all of the bases – the consciousness that possesses Divine 
knowledge. A wonderful symbolism! Holy Spirit gives the Knowledge of our Lord 
by the will of Jesus to those who ask for it - for nothing. Jesus Christ addressing 
his disciples said that when the Holy Spirit comes he will guide them into all truth: 
for he will not speak of Himself but he will say he will hear and will proclaim the 
future for them. "But the Comforter, the Holy Spirit, whom the Father will send 
in My name, will teach you everything and remind you all that I said to you" 
(John 14-26). However, as I noticed the vergers are almost interested in the gifts 
of the Holy Spirit any more after the initial Christians and they easily gradually 
turned away from Him. I wrote about this in my articles "The collapse of religion, 
eternal love" and "Christianity."  

TREE OF LIFE. We found that the river water of life is the symbol of the Holy 
Spirit and now let’s try to decipher the symbols tree of life, and its leaves.  

In the midst of the street of it, and on either side of the river, was there the tree 
of life, which bare twelve manner of fruits, and yielded her fruit every month: 
and the leaves of the tree were for the healing of the nations. (Revelation 22-2).  



As to some persons the symbol of the Tree of Life in Christianity was only a guide 
of divine grace, and as to some others - in its nature it had a protective effect 
against disease and death.  

In "Revelation" of John the Tree of Life has an entirely different symbolism which 
differs radically from the well-known symbols and I find it difficult to give a full 
and unambiguous explanation. The Tree of Life appears to me to consist of twelve 
universes, or the universe consisting of twelve dimensional sub-levels. John 
presents these universes to us in the form of tree leaves, which, as he explains, is 
intended to heal the nations. In the parallel universe there are no humans, no 
peoples, only the Angels. Apparently, there exist many forms of Angels and in a 
figurative sense John refers to them as peoples. The Tree of Life yields fruit twelve 
times and in each month out of those twelve months she gives her own fruit. I 
make out from John's explanation with different symbols that in these universes the 
Angels are considered to be sick until they get twelve months education - absolute 
knowledge of the Holy Spirit and the relevant life experience. But John has no 
doubt as to the duration of the month, and me too - I naturally have no idea of that 
thing too. I percept it in the following way: During the conditional month, for 
instance Angels of the first level will after the God’s judgment live on the first 
level or universe and receiving the appropriate education and -training in a 
particular program - will move to the second level, and so on. That's it. So it is not 
everything that looks the way the servants of the church imagine. Our souls too, 
becoming angels in the world beyond, will learn and work as the angels worked in 
the 'Revelation' of St. John the Theologian. Now I understand the words of Jesus, 
"Be faithful up to death and I will give you the crown of life." Even knowing so 
little one may imagine well enough as to what the requirements will be to the very 
few human souls who are trying to get into this wonderful world of Divine 
knowledge and love. A human soul or an angel tries to climb the stairs of twelve 
levels of parallel spaces to the dwelling of the Creator.  

Few persons in our world, where now mainly reigns indifference and hatred, 
deserve to get into the kingdom of heaven of the Holy Trinity. And what drove the 
human society to the present situation? Within two thousand years hundreds of 
thousands of churches were built on earth and the clergymen were involved in 
educating people on the Christian canons. They took on that job and as a result it is 
not religious society we have today but a sick one. Since the beginning of the last 
century some potential assassins are elected to be heads of all states in all countries 
throughout the world that in the past century killed more than 100 million people, 
and now are getting prepared for World War III whereafter some little quantity 
sick people will remain. All of this suggest that the higher clergy could not cope 



with their task, which they took over and as a result they got a sick society instead 
of a religious one. And this condition is not only in the Christianity but in the 
remaining three religions. I keep asking myself whether the situation can be 
changed, and I answer to myself - yes, because no matter what happens God loves 
us. But, unfortunately, people have gone too far to want to change something.  

But God gave people the option to try themselves. Therefore, man is endowed with 
free will the other side of which is the responsibility for one's actions in one's life. 
And the subsequent life on earth depended on the decision and the choice of the 
people which was rejected by ungrateful humanity. 

 


